
The Government Handbook
When we first learn how to drive an automobile, there are both
written  and  hands  on  instruction.   There  are  irrefutable
principles that must be applied in order to make it to your
destination.  For instance, keeping your hands on the steering
wheel  and  making  sure  to  drive  in  your  lane  is  not
negotiable.  Only idiots or those completely misinformed would
drive in such a manner as to foolishly bring about harm to
themselves or others.  For the most part people are properly
taught how to motor about. But even with proper teaching,
mistakes  are  sometimes  made.   Sometimes  the  results  are
tragic.

When it comes to our republic, the Founding Fathers left us a
beautiful instruction manual.  It is called the United States
Constitution and Bill of Rights.  It was inspired by the sound
irrefutable principles enumerated in the Holy Bible as well
some other influences including Blacks Law and Aristotle’s Law
of Identity.  The Founders did not want the government to be
the center of their lives as a dictatorship or overtaxing
burden.  Not since during the time of Moses and the children
of  Israel  did  leaders  encourage  individuals  to  be  self
governed,  as  opposed  to  being  lorded  over  by  a  bully
government.   Of  course,  they  understood  that  for  such  an
arrangement to be successful, the people had to be of high
moral character.

No liberty oriented government can be sustained if they refuse
to  properly  instruct  their  offspring  about  that  form  of
government they hope to sustain it.  Our Constitutionally
limited form of government has been in danger of sliding into
oblivion since 1913.  That is when world leaders convened a
meeting  on Jekyll Island off the coast of Georgia.  At that
gathering, the decision was made to methodically chip away at
the “We the People” aspects of American life and replace it
with centralized government, mob rule and over taxation.  But
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most important on their list to wipe from our republic was the
Judeo/Christian ethics that were the bedrock and inspiring
foundations of this land of liberty.

They  knew  that  quickly  stripping  away  our  constitutional
restraints upon government would not be tolerated.  Americans
for the most part believed in the one and true living GOD of
Abraham, Isaac and Jacob.  Their families were intact with
parents in firm control of the scholastic instruction of their
children and there were no impediments to the free utilization
of the Second Amendment.  The globalists of Jeckyll Island
cringed at the thought of you and I being free from government
tyranny in a land of Liberty and Justice for all.

If  you  are  a  true  believer  in  Jesus  Christ  and  want  to
maintain  and  strengthen  our  Christian  heritage  learn  and
support the First and Second Amendments of the United States
Constitution.  They are as follows in the government handbook
known as the Amendments to the Constitution.

Amendment 1.

Congress shall make no law respecting an establishment of
religion,  or  prohibiting  the  free  exercise  thereof;  or
abridging the freedom of speech, or the press: or the right of
the  people  peaceably  to  assemble,  and  to  petition  the
government  for  a  redress  of  grievances.

Amendment 11.

A well regulated Militia, being necessary to the security of a
free State, the right of the people to keep and bear Arms,
shall not be infringed.

My friend, if you don’t know your rights, you don’t have any. 
For too long, far too many of my fellow Christians have been
as proud as peacocks in their sustained no caring attitude for
our  Republic.   Many  Christians  do  not  care  about  America
beyond  abortion,  pornography  and  maybe  bad  movies.  Those



topics  are  extremely  important,  especially  the  murder  of
innocent babies. But if we allow our freedoms and liberties to
be whittled away, the ability to stop abortion and curtail
other evils will be greatly inhibited.  Remember, with freedom
comes  responsibility.  In  fact,  together  both  freedom  and
responsibility equal Liberty.  Let us together properly use
our  Liberty  to  build  a  better  America  that  fulfils  her
manifest  destiny  of  greatness.   God  bless  you.  God  bless
America and may America bless God.  Be blessed via The Ron
Edwards Experience talk show every Friday at 1:00 PM EDT, 4:00
PM EDT on americamatters.us.
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